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Assistant City Administrator – Director, Nixa Utilities and Public Works 

Background 

Nixa Electric utilizes certified tree trimming contractors to assist with vegetation control around 
overhead power lines. The most recent contract expired at the end of 2021 and a new contract is 
needed for continued operations. 

Following the 2007 and 2008 Ice Storms ‐ Nixa Electric began using certified tree trimming contractors to 
assist the utility with clearing power lines of limbs. Using certified contractors has become vital for the 
utility to keep a high level of reliability across the electric distribution system. In addition to raising 
reliability, using a contractor with certified arborist adds a level of confidence for both the utility and the 
customers. Customer support for tree trimming operations is as high as it’s ever been. 

The program, as well as the cost to support it has increased over the years from a very limited amount in 
the early years costing around $50,000, to a much larger program today with budget authorization of 
$350,000 in 2022. Funds for the program are used for tree trimming and tree removal associated with 
overhead lines as well as vegetation management (mowing and spraying) in rights‐of‐way and 
easements. A smaller part of the program includes other related items such as treatments against 
Emerald Ash Borer in Nixa parks and a limited tree voucher program. This program is used to replace 
some customer‐owned qualifying trees that have been removed from private property near or growing 
into power line to locations away from the lines.  

Analysis 

Staff solicited proposals for tree trimming and line clearing from the public. The successful bidder would 
be contracted for a period of three years with the potential for two additional 1‐year periods. Bids are 
received for an hourly cost basis for personnel and equipment. In addition to other responsibilities, our 
in‐house three trimmer/certified arborist meets with customers prior to any work, develops work orders 
and provides daily oversite of the contract work assuring quality and proper cleanup.  

Only two proposals were received, one each from Ark‐O‐Mo and Rumfelt Tree Service. Both have been 
reviewed and ranked by staff. Rumfelt Tree Service submitted the best qualified proposal. Rumfelt Tree 
Service happens to be the same company with the recently expired contract. The company has worked 
for Nixa Utilities for several years and is highly qualified to complete tree trimming operations around 
overhead high voltage power lines. All company personnel are responsible and work very well 
with our customers.  

The attached Resolution #2022‐022 authorizes the City Administrator to execute a contract with Rumfelt 
Tree Service.  

Recommendation 

Staff recommends passage of Resolution #2022‐022. 

Page 1 of 1 



RESOLUTION NO. 2022-022 

Page 1 of 2 

A RESOLUTION OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NIXA AUTHORIZING THE CITY 1 
ADMINISTRATOR TO EXECUTE A CONTRACT WITH RUMFELT TREE SERVICE 2 
FOR VEGETATION MANAGEMENT SERVICES. 3 

_________________________ 4 
 5 

WHEREAS the City’s electric utility utilizes contractors to assist with vegetation 6 
management and control around the City’s powerlines and overhead utilities; and 7 

 8 
WHEREAS City staff have solicited proposals for vegetation management 9 

services (FFP-055-2021/E); and 10 
 11 
WHEREAS after evaluating all submitted proposals, staff have recommended 12 

Rumfelt Tree Service as the most qualified firm; and 13 
 14 
WHEREAS the City Council desires to contract with Rumfelt Tree Services for 15 

vegetation management services. 16 
 17 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 18 

NIXA, AS FOLLOWS, THAT: 19 
 20 

SECTION 1: The City Administrator, or designee, is hereby authorized to execute 21 
the “Professional Services Contract” (“Contract”) attached hereto, and incorporated 22 
herein by this reference, as “Resolution Exhibit A,” with Rumfelt Tree Service. Said 23 
Contract shall be in substantially similar form as the document attached hereto as 24 
“Resolution Exhibit A.” The City Administrator and the officers of the City are hereby 25 
authorized to do all things necessary or convenient to carry out the terms and intent of 26 
this Resolution. 27 

 28 
SECTION 2: This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its final 29 

passage by the City Council and after its approval by the Mayor, subject to the provisions 30 
of section 3.11(g) of the City Charter. 31 
 32 
 33 

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank. Signatures follow on next page.] 34 
 35 
 36 
 37 
 38 
 39 
 40 
 41 
 42 
 43 
 44 
 45 
 46 



RESOLUTION NO. 2022-022 
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ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL THIS 14th DAY OF FEBRUARY 2022. 47 
 48 
ATTEST: 49 
 50 
________________________    __________________________ 51 
CITY CLERK       PRESIDING OFFICER 52 
 53 
APPROVED BY THE MAYOR. 54 
 55 
ATTEST: 56 
         57 
________________________    __________________________  58 
CITY CLERK       MAYOR 59 
 60 
APPROVED AS TO FORM:    __________________________ 61 
        DATE OF APPROVAL 62 
________________________ 63 
CITY ATTORNEY          64 
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RFP-055-2021/E

Vegetation Management/Tree Removal

Issue Date: 12/20/2021

Questions Deadline: 12/30/2021 04:00 PM (CT)

Response Deadline: 1/7/2022 10:00 AM (CT)

Contact Information

Contact: Stephanie Ewing
Address: Public Works

1111 Kathryn Street
Nixa, MO 65714
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Event Information

Number: RFP-055-2021/E
Title: Vegetation Management/Tree Removal
Type: Request for Proposal
Issue Date: 12/20/2021
Question Deadline: 12/30/2021 04:00 PM (CT)
Response Deadline: 1/7/2022 10:00 AM (CT)
Notes: The City of Nixa is issuing a Request for Proposal for the procurement of Vegetation

Management and Tree Removal.
 
The City highly encourages electronic submissions via this online bidding system as
it expedites the process and helps to alleviate errors.
 
Paper bids will still be accepted.  Bids must be delivered by the stated close date
and time. 
 
Public opening of bid responses will take place at the stated close date and time at:
 
City of Nixa
Public Works
1111 Kathryn St.
Nixa, MO 65714

Questions can be submitted through this electronic bidding system.
 
The City of Nixa reserves the right to accept or refuse any or all bids. 

Ship To Information

Contact: Brian Denney
Address: Electric

1111 Kathryn Street
Nixa, MO 65714

Phone: (417) 725-2353

Billing Information

Address: 715 W. Mt. Vernon Street
PO Box 395
Nixa, MO 65714

Phone: (417) 725-2353

Bid Attachments

Scope of Work-Tree Trimming RFP 2022.pdf View Online

Scope of Work/RFP Requirements

Terms and Conditions-Tree Trimming RFP 2022.pdf View Online

Terms and Conditions

Sample Work Order-Daily Log.pdf View Online

Sample Work Order

Contract for Tree Trimming RFP 2022.pdf View Online

Sample Contract
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Affidavit of Business Entity.pdf View Online

E-Verify

Requested Attachments

Sample Detailed Daily Work Log
(Attachment required)

Please upload a sample of your daily work log

E-Verify
(Attachment required)

Please download the "Affidavit of Business Entity", located on the Attachment tab. Complete the document and upload
it here.

No Response Form

Please download the "No Response Form", located on the Attachment tab. Complete the document and upload it
here.

Other Attachment

If you have additional documentation you wish to provide, please upload it here. File size limitation is 250MB. If your
files are larger than the limitation, a zip file containing the documents can also be uploaded.

Bid Attributes

1 Introduction

There are attributes, including this one, associated with this proposal.  Some are notes and require no response,
but most have a required response.  **Please select each page on the right-hand side of the blue bar below (at the
bottom of this list of attributes) in order to view the next page of Bid Attributes**

2 Attachments Required

Be sure to upload all required documents and forms to the"Response Attachments" Tab.

3 RFP Submission Response

The City of Nixa prefers responses to be submitted online via our electronic system. Submissions may be submitted
manually. Manual submissions must be delivered to the Purchasing Department, in a sealed envelope by the date
and time stated. No fax or email submissions will be accepted. Only one format is needed. Manual submission shall
consist of one (1) original hard copy. For any questions, please contact the Purchasing Department at
417.449.0555. 

4 Scope of Work

Download the Scope of Work, located on the "Attachments" tab.  Thoroughly review and indicate below.

 I have downloaded, read and agree.
(Required: Check if applicable)

5 General Terms and Conditions

Download the General Terms and Conditions, located on the "Attachments" tab.  Thoroughly review and indicate
below.

 I have downloaded, read and agree.
(Required: Check if applicable)
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6 Proposal Opening

Any proposal received later than the specified time shall be disqualified.

Questions pertaining to the proposal should be addressed in the Questions Tab or directly to the Purchasing
Department at 417.449.0555.

If the City of Nixa office where bids/proposals are to be submitted is closed due to inclement weather, natural
disaster, or for any other cause including if the electronic bid system is unavailable on the due date, the deadline
for submission shall be extended until the next City calendar business day, unless the bidder is otherwise notified.
The time of day for submission shall remain the same.

7 Section 2

PROPOSAL REQUIREMENTS
The following items require an answer

8 Evaluation of Proposals

Designated City of Nixa staff will evaluate all proposals submitted and compare them to the evaluation factors to
determine professional qualification(s) to fulfill the needs of the City of Nixa. Proposals will be scored according to
the scoring legend below.
 
Proposal evaluation factors to be considered are:

Knowledge of the City of Nixa and their utility services-15 points
Scope of services offered- 20 points
Cost of services- 30 points
Relevant experience with services for public sector and/or large commercial clients- 25 points
References- 10 points
Total: 100 points

The City of Nixa reserves the right to reject any or all proposals or any part thereof and to accept in whole, or in
part, such proposals as may be deemed in the best interest of the City. City staff will recommend City Council award
a contract to the bank which best fits the needs of the City.

 I acknowledge
(Required: Check if applicable)
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9 Anti-Collusion Statement

By offering a submission to this Bid, the bidder certifies the bidder has not divulged, discussed, or compared the Bid
with other bidders and has not colluded with any other bidder or parties whatsoever. The bidder also certifies, and
in the case of a joint Bid, each party thereto certifies as to their own organization, that in connection with this Bid: 
 
Any prices and/or cost data submitted have been arrived at independently, without consultation, communication, or
agreement for the purpose of restricting competition, as to any matter relating to such prices and/or cost data, with
any other bidder or with any competitor. 

Any prices and/or cost data for this Bid have not knowingly been disclosed by the bidder and will not knowingly be
disclosed by the bidder prior to the scheduled opening directly or indirectly to any other bidder or to any
competitor. 

No attempt has been made or will be made by the bidder to induce any other person or firm to submit or not to
submit a Bid for the purpose of restricting competition. 
 
The only person or persons interested in this Bid, principal or principals are named therein and that no person
other than therein mentioned has any interest in this Bid or in the contract to be entered into. 
 
No person or agency has been employed or retained to solicit or secure the contract upon an agreement or
understanding for a commission, percentage, brokerage, or contingent fee exempting bona fide employees or
established commercial agencies maintained by the Purchaser for the purpose of doing business.
 
I affirm that I am duly authorized to execute this contract; that this company, corporation, firm, partnership or
individual has not prepared this bid in collusion with any other Bidder, and that the contents of this bid as to prices,
terms or conditions of said bid have not been communicated by the undersigned nor by any employee or agent to
any other person engaged in this type of business prior to the official opening of this bid.  

 I agree.
(Required: Check if applicable)

1
0

No Deviations or Exceptions

I certify that there are NO deviations or exceptions from the attached specific terms, conditions, and
specifications.  

 [Please select]   Agree - No Deviations   Do Not Agree - Please see below
(Required: Check only one)

1
1

Deviations and Exceptions

If your company intends to deviate from the Specifications listed in the attached documents, all such
deviations and exceptions must be listed here, with complete and detailed conditions and information
included.  The City will consider any deviations or exceptions in its bid award decisions.  The City
reserves the right to accept or reject any proposals based upon any deviations indicated below.  If
none, please enter N/A (Not Applicable). 

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
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1
2

Contract Terms

Please download and review the Sample Contract. 
By checking this box, you agree to accept this Contract as written.
 
If you do not agree to the terms of this contract, please upload a Contract you would like to be considered in the
Response Attachments.

 I agree.
(Required: Check if applicable)

Bid Lines

1 35' to 40' Trim Lift (Mini Bucket)
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 75 characters allowed)

2 55' Trim Lift with Chip Box (Forestry Setup)
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3 Dump Truck with Chip Box (Forestry Setup)
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4 12" Rated Self-Feed Drum or Disc Chipper
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

5 15" Rated Self-Feed Drum or Disc Chipper with winch
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

6 Supervisor Vehicle (4x4 - 1/2 ton pick up truck or similar)
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

7 Mechanical Mower/Grinder-Skid Steer with mulching head (FAE or Fecon or Similar)
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

8 Mechanical Mower/Grinder-Skidder with mulching head (FAE or Fecon or Similar)
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

9 Mechanical Mower/Grinder Excavator with mulching head 
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
0

Mechanical Trimmer (Jarraff or SkyTrim or Similar)
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for
completing line clearance tree pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris
removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

(Required: Numbers only)

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

 

 

 
(Optional: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
1

Labor- Line Clearance Crew Supervisor
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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1
2

Labor- Line Clearance Trained Crew Leader
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1
3

Labor- Line Clearance Trained Journeyman Climber/Trimmer
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1
4

Labor- Line Clearance Climber/Trimmer Trainee
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1
5

Labor-Crew Groundman
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1
6

Labor-Equipment Operator
(Response required)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Supplier Information

Company Name:

Contact Name:

Address:

 

 

 

Phone:

Fax:

Email:

Supplier Notes

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

By signing below, the bidder shall hereby declare understanding, agreement and certification of compliance to provide
the items and/or services, at the prices quoted, in accordance with all requirements and specifications contained herein
and the Terms and Conditions. The bidder shall further agree that the language of this RFP shall govern in the event of a
conflict with his/her bid. In addition, the bidder shall further agree that upon receipt of an authorized purchase order from
the City of Nixa or when a Contract Resolution is signed and issued by an authorized official of the City of Nixa, a binding
contract shall exist between the bidder and the City of Nixa.

Print Name Signature
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1 35' to 40' Trim Lift (Mini Bucket)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $17.48 Total: $17.48

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

2012

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

Ford

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

550

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

2 55' Trim Lift with Chip Box (Forestry Setup)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $21.42 Total: $21.42

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

2013

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

GMC

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

7500

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

3 Dump Truck with Chip Box (Forestry Setup)

UOM: Per Hour No Bid

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

No response

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

No response
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3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

No response

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

4 12" Rated Self-Feed Drum or Disc Chipper

UOM: Per Hour Price: $7.14 Total: $7.14

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

2015

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

Brush Bandit

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

990

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

5 15" Rated Self-Feed Drum or Disc Chipper with winch

UOM: Per Hour Price: $13.26 Total: $13.26

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

2019

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

Brush Bandit

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

1590

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

6 Supervisor Vehicle (4x4 - 1/2 ton pick up truck or similar)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $7.14 Total: $7.14

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.
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Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

2018

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

Ford

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

250

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

7 Mechanical Mower/Grinder-Skid Steer with mulching head (FAE or Fecon or Similar)

UOM: Per Hour Price: $32.64 Total: $32.64

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

2015

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

Takeuchi

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

TL8

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

8 Mechanical Mower/Grinder-Skidder with mulching head (FAE or Fecon or Similar)

UOM: Per Hour No Bid

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

No response

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

No response

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

No response
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4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

9 Mechanical Mower/Grinder Excavator with mulching head 

UOM: Per Hour No Bid

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

No response

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

No response

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

No response

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

1
0

Mechanical Trimmer (Jarraff or SkyTrim or Similar)

UOM: Per Hour No Bid

Item Notes: Prices shall include all necessary tools, material and equipment for completing line clearance tree
pruning, tree removal and rigging, debris removal and haul off and herbicide applications.

Item Attributes

1. Enter the year of the model to be used

No response

2. Enter the make of the unit to be used.

No response

3. Enter the model of the unit to be used.

No response

4. Other type of Equipment

Please list the type of Equipment you have equivalent, if different than above.

No response

1
1

Labor- Line Clearance Crew Supervisor

UOM: Per Hour Price: $50.00 Total: $50.00

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

1
2

Labor- Line Clearance Trained Crew Leader

UOM: Per Hour Price: $40.00 Total: $40.00

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.
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1
3

Labor- Line Clearance Trained Journeyman Climber/Trimmer

UOM: Per Hour Price: $40.00 Total: $40.00

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

1
4

Labor- Line Clearance Climber/Trimmer Trainee

UOM: Per Hour Price: $0.00 Total: $0.00

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

1
5

Labor-Crew Groundman

UOM: Per Hour Price: $33.00 Total: $33.00

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

1
6

Labor-Equipment Operator

UOM: Per Hour Price: $38.76 Total: $38.76

Item Notes: Please submit the hourly labor rage for this position.

Response Total: $300.84
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